
NFPA® “WHAT KIND OF COOK ARE YOU IN THE 
KITCHEN? QUIZ” SWEEPSTAKES 

Official Rules 
By participating in this Sweepstakes, entrants accept and agree to be bound by the following Official Rules: 

 
1. NO PURCHASE OR PAYMENT OF ANY KIND IS NECESSARY TO ENTER THIS SWEEPSTAKES. 
A PURCHASE WILL NOT INCREASE YOUR CHANCES OF WINNING. THE ODDS OF WINNING A 
SWEEPSTAKES PRIZE DEPENDS ON THE NUMBER OF ELIGIBLE ENTRIES RECEIVED. 
 
2. SPONSOR & ADMINISTRATOR. The NFPA “What Kind of Cook are you in the Kitchen Quiz” 
Sweepstakes (the Sweepstakes) is sponsored and administered by the National Fire Protection Association® 
(NFPA), One Batterymarch Park, Quincy, Massachusetts 02169-7471, and The Center for Campus Fire Safety 
(CCFS), 10 State Street, Newburyport, Massachusetts 01950 (each of NFPA, and CCFS individually and 
collectively, the Sponsor). 
 
3. BACKGROUND. The Sweepstakes helps to raise awareness among college-aged students who live in on- and 
off-campus housing about the dangers of cooking fires. Students who have access to kitchens and make meals 
using stoves and ovens have the opportunity to recognize unsafe practices and learn the appropriate way to cook 
meals that will reduce the risk for injuries and damage caused by fire. 
 
4. ELIGIBILITY. Eligibility for the Sweepstakes is open to natural persons who are legal residents of the fifty 
(50) United States and the District of Columbia and who are (18) years of age and older and are enrolled in an 
institute of higher learning and have an e-mail address with a .edu domain name.  Employees, directors, officers 
of the Sponsor (including its affiliates and advertising agencies and sweepstakes administrators, and any third 
party organization Sponsor may be working with on the Sweepstakes, including Qzzr) and their immediate 
families (spouse, parents, children, siblings, and their respective spouses) and household members are not eligible 
to enter. This Sweepstakes is void where prohibited. 

5. THE SWEEPSTAKES PERIOD. The Sweepstakes begins on Thursday, September 1, 2016 and the winners 
will be announced on or about Monday, October 3, 2016, following Campus Fire Safety Month.  The period for 
entering the Sweepstakes begins at 10:00 a.m. Eastern Time (ET) on Thursday, September 1, 2016 and ends 11:59 
p.m. ET on Friday, September 30, 2016 (the "Sweepstakes Entry Period").  

6. HOW TO ENTER. To enter the Sweepstakes, Participants must be eligible, must comply with these Official 
Rules, and must complete and submit the online quiz on cooking fire safety (8 questions, approximately 1 minute 
to complete), found at www.campusfiresafety.org/cooking during the Sweepstakes Entry Period.  Entries will be 
accepted by using the Qzzr interactive quiz platform located at the above mentioned website.  Participants will 
each receive one (1) sweepstakes entry for submitting a completed quiz and submitting their name, institute of 
higher education, a valid email address (using a .edu domain) and phone number.  All Entries submitted, 
regardless of score received, will be given equal weight during the random drawing for winners.  Once an Entry is 
submitted, it cannot be modified, changed or altered in any way for any reason.  Participants may submit only a 
single Entry.  Once entered in the Sweepstakes, it is solely the responsibility of each Participant to ensure the 
contact information we have for you is current.  Sponsor is not responsible for any failure to contact you if the 
contact information is not current.   
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7. WINNER SELECTION. Two (2) winning entries will be randomly drawn from among all eligible entries.  
All decisions of the Sponsor, and its sweepstakes administrators are final.   

SELECTION OF A WINNER DOES NOT INDICATE THE SPONSOR(S) HAVE ANY 
OPINION OF THE ACCURACY OF THE ANSWERS IN YOUR COMPLETED SUBMISSION.   

8. PRIZE. Each winning Entry will receive a $500USD American Express® gift card.  In addition, the winners’ 
names may be shared on the Sponsor’s websites (www.campusfiresafety.org and www.nfpa.org) and promotional 
materials.  Prizes are awarded “as is.”  No substitutions are allowed.   Prizes will be awarded, provided a 
sufficient number of eligible entries are received. Prizes may not be transferred, substituted or redeemed for cash. 
Sweepstakes winners will not be compensated with a salary.  Sponsor reserves the right to substitute a prize of 
equal or greater value. Sponsor may, in its sole discretion, elect to terminate, postpone or cancel the Sweepstakes 
at any time.  Winning Participants will in addition have to accept certain rules and restrictions concerning the use 
of NFPA logos, messages and images and the rights of the NFPA.  
 

The gift card awarded as a prize under this Sweepstakes is given away by and behalf of the Sponsor.  
American Express® is neither a Sponsor of nor affiliated with the Sweepstakes and has neither 
endorsed nor approved of this Sweepstakes. 

 
9. PRIZE RESTRICTIONS. Winning Participants are subject to verification of identity and eligibility prior to 
the award of any prize.  Winning Participants will be notified by email at the email address provided on the Entry. 
Within seven (7) days of the date that notification is sent, the winning Participants must, by return email or by 
other means as may be directed by the Sponsor, provide a response indicating each Participant’s acceptance of the 
prize and providing the Sponsor with confirmation of the winning Participants’ identity and eligibility and 
agreement with the terms and conditions contained in these Official Rules.  FAILURE TO PROMPTLY 
CONFIRM OR TO COMPLY WITH THESE OFFICIAL RULES WILL RESULT IN PARTICIPANT’S 
DISQUALIFICATION.    Participants who do not provide a timely and complete response will be disqualified 
and will forfeit any prize.  In addition, any prize will be forfeited if any winning Participant is found to be 
ineligible, not in compliance with these Official Rules, or declines to accept the prize.  All other expenses and 
costs related to the participation in the Sweepstakes, or any prize that’s awarded are the Participant’s sole 
responsibility.   
 
10. CONDITIONS OF PARTICIPATION. By entering the Sweepstakes, Participants agree to be bound by 
these Official Rules and to accept and abide by all decisions of the Sponsor with regard to the interpretation and 
implementation of the Official Rules, and the Sweepstakes. By entering the Sweepstakes and by accepting status 
as Participant or any prize, each Participant consents to the use of his/her names, city and state of residence, voice, 
image, photograph or other likeness, without further compensation, notification or permission in any publicity or 
advertising carried out by Sponsor or any related entities in any and all media now known or hereinafter 
developed without territorial or time limitation, except where prohibited by law.  Participants acknowledge that 
nothing herein shall constitute an employment, joint venture, or partnership relationship between entrant and 
Sponsor.  In no way is an entrant to be construed as the agent or to be acting as the agent of Sponsor in any 
respect.   
 
11.  GENERAL RULES.  Taxes, if any, related to the prize are the responsibility of each individual winner.    
The Sponsor reserves the right, at its sole discretion to disqualify any individual that tampers or attempts to 
tamper with the entry process or the operation of the Sweepstakes, violates the Official Rules, or acts in any 
unsportsmanlike or disruptive manner, or with the intent or result of annoying, abusing, threatening or harassing 
any other person.  Sponsor’s failure to enforce any term of these Official Rules shall not constitute a waiver of 
that provision.  Sponsor reserves the right to cancel, terminate or postpone the Sweepstakes in its sole discretion.  
Sponsor reserves the right to terminate or cancel the Sweepstakes in the event there are insufficient Entries as 
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determined by Sponsor in its sole discretion.  In the event of termination or cancelation of the Sweepstakes, the 
prizes may be awarded by alternate means in the Sponsor’s discretion.  The decisions of Sponsor, its affiliates and 
advertising and promotional agencies and Sweepstakes administrators’ decisions are final on all matters relating 
to this Sweepstakes.  
 
12. RELEASE AND LIMITATION OF LIABILITY. NO RESPONSIBILITY OR LIABILITY IS ASSUMED 
FOR DAMAGES, LOSSES, OR INJURY RESULTING FROM ACCEPTANCE OR USE OF ANY PRIZE OR 
PARTICIPATION IN THE SWEEPSTAKES AND SPONSOR SHALL HAVE NO LIABILITY OR 
RESPONSIBILITY FOR, AND EACH PARTICIPANT FOR AND ON BEHALF OF THEMSELVES, THEIR 
HEIR(S) AND SUCCESSORS, HEREBY RELEASES, INDEMNIFIES AND HOLD HARMLESS SPONSOR, 
ITS EMPLOYEES, DIRECTORS, OFFICERS, AGENTS, REPRESENTATIVES AND ANYONE WORKING 
AT THE DIRECTION OR WITH THE PERMISSION OF SPONSOR FROM, ANY CLAIM ARISING IN 
CONNECTION WITH PARTICIPATION IN THIS SWEEPSTAKES, AND/OR ANY PRIZE AWARDED.  
PARTICIPANTS ASSUME ALL LIABILITY FOR ANY INJURY OR DAMAGE CAUSED, OR CLAIMED 
TO BE CAUSED, BY PARTICIPATION IN THIS SWEEPSTAKES,	AND/OR USE OF ANY PRIZE.  THIS 
LIMITATION OF LIABILITY IS A COMPREHENSIVE LIMITATION OF LIABILITY THAT APPLIES TO 
ALL DAMAGES OF ANY KIND, INCLUDING (WITHOUT LIMITATION) COMPENSATORY, DIRECT, 
INDIRECT, OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES; LOSS OF DATA, INCOME OR PROFIT; LOSS OR 
DAMAGE TO PROPERTY; AND CLAIMS OF THIRD PARTIES.  THE SPONSOR AND ITS AGENTS ARE 
NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELIVERIES OR ANY A FAILURE TO DELIVER BY ANY COURIER, POSTAL 
SERVICE, TECHNICAL, HARDWARE, SOFTWARE OR TELEPHONE OR FACSIMILE MALFUNCTIONS 
OF ANY KIND OR LOST OR UNAVAILABLE NETWORK CONNECTIONS OR FAILED, INCORRECT, 
INCOMPLETE, INACCURATE, GARBLED OR DELAYED ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATIONS 
ASSOCIATED WITH OR UTILIZED IN THIS SWEEPSTAKES OR	BY ANY HUMAN ERROR THAT MAY 
OCCUR IN THE PROCESSING OF THE SWEEPSTAKES.   
 
The Released Parties are not responsible for late, incomplete, inaccurate submissions, or problems of any kind, 
whether mechanical, human or electronic. The Released Parties are not responsible for technical, hardware or 
software malfunctions, telephone failures of any kind, lost or unavailable network connections, inability to access 
a web site, inability to submit an entry, or fraud, incomplete, garbled, or delayed computer transmissions or 
inaccurate transcription of entry information, whether caused by Sponsor, users or by any of the equipment or 
programming associated with or utilized in the Sweepstakes or by any technical or human error which may occur 
in the processing of submissions which may damage a user’s system or limit an eligible participant’s ability to 
participate in the Sweepstakes. The Released Parties are not responsible for late, incomplete, or damaged entries. 
Entry materials that have been tampered with or altered are void. Should any portion of the Sweepstakes be, in 
Sponsor’s sole opinion, compromised by virus, worms, bugs, non-authorized human intervention or other causes 
which, in the sole opinion of the Sponsor, corrupt or impair the administration, security, fairness, integrity or 
proper play, or submission of entries, or should the Sweepstakes be unable to run as planned for any other reason, 
Sponsor reserves the right at its sole discretion to terminate the Sweepstakes. 
 
13. APPLICABLE LAWS AND JURISDICTION. This Sweepstakes is subject to all applicable federal, state, 
and local laws and regulations. Issues concerning the construction, validity, interpretation and enforceability of 
these Official Rules and of the rights and responsibilities of the participants in and Sponsor of the Sweepstakes 
shall be governed by the laws of the State of Massachusetts, without regard to any principles of conflict of laws. 
All disputes arising out of or in connection with this Sweepstakes shall be resolved individually, and without 
resort to class action, exclusively by the United States District Court for the District of Massachusetts or the 
appropriate Massachusetts state court for the City of Quincy, Norfolk County, and participants in consent to the 
jurisdiction of such courts with respect to all such disputes. To the extent permitted by applicable law, all 
judgments or awards shall be limited to actual out-of-pocket damages (excluding attorneys’ fees) associated with 
participation in this Sweepstakes and shall not include any indirect, punitive, incidental and/or consequential 
damages. 


